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THE EARTH IS A PRISON. There was a galactic war in the Universe millions of years ago. Angels rebelled 
against the Order of the Kingdom and declared war on Elohim. The Universe is run by a system of 
Councils. The Highest Council is where Elohim resides with the ruling elders, including Eliyahu. In the 
beginning, Elohim created only angels. We don't know precisely how many malakim (angels) were 
created at first. But one truth resounds with all of them - They were created to live forever. The reason 
is because of the Universe's first law, which states that you cannot destroy energy. So how could there 
be a war if you can't kill angels? Angels can battle each other but not terminate their kind. The only 
thing you can do is to bind or imprison them, but first, you must immobilize them. The technology was 
invented by an archangel named Lucifer, the morning star. It started when Lucifer made a challenge 
to become the head of the Supreme Council and was rightly rejected; therefore, he led a rebellion 
among the Sons of Elohim, which destroyed many planets throughout the Universe. Lucifer created a 
New Order that mirrored the Councils of Elohim and declared himself God. By the time this happened, 
the angels had planted most of the Universe with life, and many thriving civilizations emerged that 
worshipped Elohim. In his pride and anger, Lucifer sets out to destroy everything Elohim has done. 
The planets and solar systems that refused to join the New Order were depopulated or obliterated, 
including the former Earth. The Earth was made to be without form and void; it did not happen by 
accident. Many civilizations fought back and were defeated. Weapons of immense power and 
destruction were invented by Lucifer and his team of Scientists who had left the order of the Kingdom. 
Angels were enticed with empty promises of kingship and dominion. The oldest lie in the Universe 
because you cannot own what belongs to all of us - an inalienable gift from the Creator (Ensof). The 
war lasted for 400 years. Lucifer attacked the Eternal City of Zion and almost succeeded in taking the 
City. He was defeated when his generals defected their ranks and turned on him after they realized 
they were serving an insane being and witnessing the senseless carnage of the war. Lucifer and his 
armada surrendered and were imprisoned, put on trial, and sentenced. To cut a very long story short. 
Lucifer, who is now named haSatan, was sentenced to a prison called the Earth. A small number of 
them were allowed to roam the Earth as disembodied spirits, rulers, and powers. Still, most of them 
were sent into human bodies to serve consecutive life sentences where they would be subjected to 
the cycles of birth and death for reformation and instruction. A marvel of creation – the human body 
was designed to imprison angelic beings on a planet that was purposefully located in an isolated region 
of the Galaxy called Sagittarius. Humanity is these fallen angels. However, not all of us here are fallen 
angels; many of us are good angels who have volunteered to come here as lights and guides to our 
fallen brothers. You shall know them by their works. The period of this imprisonment is 7,000 years, 
as categorized in the book of Enoch, who meticulously set forth events that would happen in each 
period. The book shows that wickedness will reign on the Earth for 6000 years, and in the 7th 
millennium, the Kingdom of Elohim shall be set up on Earth and haSatan bound for a thousand years. 
Many of you do not know that we have already entered the 7th millennium and are in the dark phase 
of the sabbatical of 1,000 years. The surge in evil that we are experiencing is characteristic of this time, 
but it is only for a short period. We are in a prison beautifully designed and prepared to help us 
discover our Creator's love and learn to love one another. We don't realize that Earth is not our destiny 
and never was from the beginning. We are not from here. Elohim created an endless Universe with an 
uncountable number of galaxies for our enjoyment. This is our real home among the trillion of Stars. 
We are not here to amass wealth and power, accumulate lands and property, and create war and 
suffering. This behavior is what got us trapped here, and we must unlearn these things if we are to 
merit the grand prize of being allowed to roam this majestic Universe as we have done for millions of 
years. The only way we are going to be able to earn our pardon is to receive the Kingdom's mind and 
aid its construction on Earth. We have the blueprints already. Do you want to go home? Yes or No!      


